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Editorial Review

Review
I now realize that from all the popular books on physics that I have read or skimmed, and there have been
many, I have learned nothing! But your book I remember very well, and not only that but I feel that I finally
understand relativity intuitively, as much as I possibly can for a layman (and, in a way, perhaps better than
many physicists). You really have something to say, and what you say sticks to the ribs when the book is
gone. --Arthur Schwartz, M.D.

Although many books have been written about the interpretation of quantum physics, Rodney Brooks has
written a book that finally gets it entirely right... Brooks presents the news about quantum field theory in a
non-technical but accurate manner that will enlighten both the general public and the professional scientists.
His explanatory technique of using different colors to represent different fields is a stroke of pedagogical
genius. Anybody who wants to understand quantum physics should read this book. --Art Hobson, Ph.D.,
2006 Milllikan Award winner and author of "Physics: Concepts and Connections"

Applying Quantum Field Theory [to wave-particle duality] is shown to cause the 'paradox' to disappear.
Further, Brooks' attack on Special Relativity based on the behavior of fields presents the reader with a more
easily understandable picture... Despite the fact that Dr. Brooks has essentially rejected the use of
mathematics throughout, there is plenty here for specialist and interested reader to ponder. --Edward Finn,
Ph.D., past Chairman of Physics at Georgetown University and co-author of the textbook "Physics"

About the Author
Rodney A. Brooks received a Ph.D. in physics from Harvard University where he learned Quantum Field
Theory from its prime developer, Julian Schwinger. During a 25 year career at the National Institutes of
Health he published 124 refereed articles. Among his accomplishments was the design and construction of
the highest resolution PET scanner at the time. As an amateur clarinetist he founded and led a klezmer band
called Shir Delite. After retiring in 1999 he moved to New Zealand where he founded "Kiwis for Balanced
Reporting on the Middle East."

Users Review

From reader reviews:

Peter Schmidt:

The book Fields of Color: The theory that escaped Einstein make one feel enjoy for your spare time. You can
use to make your capable a lot more increase. Book can to be your best friend when you getting pressure or
having big problem along with your subject. If you can make studying a book Fields of Color: The theory
that escaped Einstein being your habit, you can get a lot more advantages, like add your own capable,
increase your knowledge about many or all subjects. You could know everything if you like start and read a
publication Fields of Color: The theory that escaped Einstein. Kinds of book are several. It means that,
science guide or encyclopedia or other individuals. So , how do you think about this guide?



Katie Johnson:

Reading a e-book can be one of a lot of task that everyone in the world likes. Do you like reading book
therefore. There are a lot of reasons why people enjoy it. First reading a book will give you a lot of new
details. When you read a reserve you will get new information because book is one of several ways to share
the information or even their idea. Second, reading a book will make you actually more imaginative. When
you examining a book especially hype book the author will bring you to imagine the story how the people do
it anything. Third, you can share your knowledge to other people. When you read this Fields of Color: The
theory that escaped Einstein, you may tells your family, friends in addition to soon about yours e-book. Your
knowledge can inspire others, make them reading a publication.

Summer McGaugh:

Do you have something that you want such as book? The guide lovers usually prefer to opt for book like
comic, small story and the biggest the first is novel. Now, why not hoping Fields of Color: The theory that
escaped Einstein that give your satisfaction preference will be satisfied by reading this book. Reading habit
all over the world can be said as the opportinity for people to know world considerably better then how they
react towards the world. It can't be explained constantly that reading practice only for the geeky person but
for all of you who wants to be success person. So , for all you who want to start examining as your good
habit, you may pick Fields of Color: The theory that escaped Einstein become your own personal starter.

Lawrence Caulfield:

Don't be worry if you are afraid that this book may filled the space in your house, you will get it in e-book
way, more simple and reachable. That Fields of Color: The theory that escaped Einstein can give you a lot of
good friends because by you taking a look at this one book you have issue that they don't and make an
individual more like an interesting person. This specific book can be one of a step for you to get success.
This publication offer you information that might be your friend doesn't know, by knowing more than
different make you to be great folks. So , why hesitate? We need to have Fields of Color: The theory that
escaped Einstein.
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